'

SPECIAL ISSUE 1
Kenya Gazette Supplement No. 6 30th July, 2024

(Kitui County Legislative Supplement No. 1)
LEGAL NOTICE No. |
THE KITUI COUNTY WARD PUBLIC FORUMS ACT, 2019
(No. 3 0f 2019)

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 24 of the Kitui County Ward
Public Forums Act, 2019, the Kitui County Assembly Service Board makes the following
Guidelines—

THE KITUI COUNTY PUBLIC FORUMS (IMPLEMENTATION) (AMENDMENT)
GUIDELINES, 2024

Citation.

1.These Guidelines may be cited as the Kimi County Public Forums
(Implementation) (Amendment) Guidelines, 2024,

Budgetary allocations.

2.That the Kitui County Public Forums (Implementation) Guidelines, 2020 be
amended under Guideline 15:

(a) in paragraph 3 by—

{i) deleting the word “three hundred” appearing on the second line and
replacing therefor with the word “four hundred and fifty”.

(ii) by deleting the amount in figures “300,000/=" appearing on the third
line and replacing therefor with figure “450,000/=".

(b) in paragraph 4 by—

(i) deleting the word “one hundred” appearing on the first line and
replacing therefor with the word “one hundred and fifty”.

(ii) by deleting the amount in figures “100,000/=" appearing on the first
line and replacing therefor with figure “150,000/=".

Made on the 29th July, 2024.

KEVIN KINENGO KATISYA,
Chairperson,
Kitui County Assembly Service Board.




